
 

 2018 Main Street Dental Vaulting Spring Spectacular – Person Responsible 
Release Form 
April 6 – 8, Moose Jaw, Saskatchewan 
 
Person Responsible Release Form-to be completed by the trainer/lunger/coach of each club, 
acknowledging responsibility for all entries from your club. 
 
Saskatchewan Equestrian Vaulting Association (SEVA), AEVA, EVABC, VaultCanada, Equestrian Canada 
 
“I hereby certify that every horse, rider and/or driver is eligible as entered and agree for myself and my 
representatives to be bound by the Constitution and rules of Equestrian Canada at this competition. It is 
hereby recognized that all equestrian sports involve inherent risk and that no helmet or protective 
equipment can protect against all foreseeable injury. I hereby accept this risk and hold harmless EC, the 
competition, their officials, organizers, agents, employees and their representatives. The person 
responsible (PR) agrees to the release of any information on the entry form to EC.” (A802.4) 
 
 “The Person Responsible for a horse must be an adult who has, or shares, responsibility for the care, 
training, custody and performance for the horse and who has official responsibility for that horse under 
EC rules and is liable under the penalty provisions of the rules for any violation of the EC rules. For the 
purpose of these rules, the Person Responsible is normally the trainer, owner or competitor who rides or 
drives the horse during an event, or a parent of legal guardian in the case of Junior Competitors. The 
Person Responsible is ultimately responsible for the conditions, fitness and management of the horse and 
is alone responsible for any act performed in the stables by himself or herself or by any other person 
withau-thorized access to the horse, or while the horse is being ridden, driven or exercised. The Person 
Responsible must hold a valid EC Sport License in good standing at the same level or higher in which the 
horse is competing. However, when the competitor is a junior, the competitor cannot be the Person 
Responsible and the Person Responsible may be a parent/guardian who must be at minimum an EC or 
USEF member in good standing. (Section A, General Regulations-Glossary: Person Responsible) 
 
Person Responsible Name (print): ___________________________________________________  
EC Number of Person Responsible: ____________________________________________________ 
Signature of Person Responsible: ____________________________DATE: ________________________ 


